
DESCRIPTION 

PACK PRICE PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

1
Forks, plastic, 6”, heavy weight, wrapped, 1000/cs, white or black 

28.60$                      18.34$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

2
Spoons, plastic, 6”, heavy weight, wrapped, 1000/cs, white or black

28.60$                      18.34$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

3

Plate, plastic, 9", 500/cs, Dart #9PWF, AMOCO, #36-791 or approved 

equal NO BID 172.08$                   NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

4
Plate, plastic, 6", 500/cs, Dart #6PWF or approved equal 

NO BID 11.98$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

5

Bowl, plastic, 5 oz., 1000/cs Sweetheart #RS5DB, Amoco #36-705 or 

approved equal NO BID 28.10$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

GROUP 1 TOTAL 57.20$                      248.84$                   -$                              

3

CENTRAL PAPER

ALWAYS AVAILABLE 

WHOLESALES & SUPPLY 

CORP.

STRONG MEDICAL 

PARTNERS LLC

1 2

Bid Tabulation 

Florencie Patton, Principal Buyer

Max Pkg 50EB / Central 5040480 

1000

1000

Max Pkg 50 SB / Central 5040481 

Harriett Bell, Buyer

ITB 59-21  "DISPOSABLE FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES"

GROUP 1:  FORKS, SPOONS, KNIVES, PLATES, BOWLS AND CONTAINERS

Hi Impact/BWKBOWLHIPS6WH

125/pk, 4 pk/carton

Famous Service/DCC6PWFPK

1000

Famous Service/DCC9PWF

1000

1000

GCN/GNR11101WR

GCN/GNR11103WR
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6

Sandwich container, Styrofoam, hinged lid, 6” x 6” x 3”, 500/cs, Amoco 

#80-600, GenPak #22500 or approved equal 42.00$                      52.69$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# Dart60HTI / Central 1720505 DCC60HT1

7

Carryout tray, 3 compartment, Styrofoam, hinged lid, 200/cs, Amoco 

#36-583-B, Dart #954T3 or approved equal 22.75$                      48.36$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

8 5 oz. Bowl, 1000/cs, Dart #5B20 or approved equal 33.50$                      63.55$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

9 10 oz. Bowl, 1000/cs, Dart #10B20 or approved equal 42.25$                      80.30$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 1 50/pack-20pack/carton

Manufacturer/Item# 

10 8 oz. Cup, 1000/cs, Dart #8J8 or approved equal 21.50$                      38.66$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 1000 25/bag - 40 bags/carton

Manufacturer/Item# 

11 10 oz. cup, 1000/cs, Dart #10J12 or approved equal 33.00$                      52.01$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 1000

Manufacturer/Item# 

12 12 oz. cup, 1000/cs, Dart #12J12 or approved equal 34.50$                      54.86$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

13 16 oz. cup, 1000/cs, Dart #16J16 or approved equal 43.50$                      77.62$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

Convgrmex 322027M / Central 170424

200

500

1000

Dart 12J12 / Central 1720017

Dart 16J16 / Central 1720029

1000

DartSB20 / Central 1720150 

1000

Dart10B/20 / Central  1720162

Dart8J8 / Central 1720009

Dart10J12 / Central 1720014

GROUP 2:  STYROFOAM/POLYSTYRENE AND WAX/LAMINATED ITEMS (INCLUDING LIDS FOR CUPS)

DCC8J8

DCC10J12

25/bag-40 bag/carton

DCC12J12

40/bag-25 bags/carton

500/carton

200/carton

DCC90HT3R

50/pack-20pack/carton

DCC5B20

25/bag, 40 bag/carton

DCC16J16

DCC10B20
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14 Straw slot lid, 16 oz Cup, 1000/cs, Dart #16SL or approved equal 19.00$                      35.09$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

15 12 oz bowl, 1000/cs, Sweetheart #RS12BY or approved equal NO BID 32.76$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# PCTYTH1001 20000

16 6” plate, 1000/cs, Sweetheart #RS6CY or approved equal NO BID 35.94$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

17 Service tray foam, 16” x 12”, 100/cs Gen Pak #11216 or approved equal 41.50$                      58.97$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

GROUP 2 TOTAL 333.50$                    630.81$                   -$                              

18

Aluminum foil H.D., 18” x 1000 ft, Reynolds #625, Alumax #125 or 

approved equal 79.40$                      133.39$                   NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

19 Aluminum foil H.D., 18” x 500 ft, Reynolds #624 or approved equal 29.00$                      66.94$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

20

Vinyl wrap, 11” x 11”, 1700 Pages/roll, Reynolds #928 or approved 

equal 19.75$                      38.42$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

21 Plastic film, 18” x 2000 ft, Reynolds #914, Bordon or approved equal 19.75$                      53.95$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

Dart165L / Central 1720236

100

GenPak 11216 / Central 2665210

1000

PCT0TK1000 60000

100/carton

GNP11216WH

100/pack-10 packs/carton

DCC16SL

1000/carton

HFA11808 / Central 302060

1 Roll

1 Roll

1 Roll

RFP625

1

1

Anchor E151111/ Central 091505 RFP910SC

Anchor AW182 / Central 091202 RFP914SC

Western 297 / Central 118110 PCT624

1700/Roll - 1 Roll Per Case 1

1000/carton

GROUP 3:  PLASTIC WRAP/VINYL WRAP/ALUMINUM FOIL, WAXED PAPER, FREEZER PAPER, BROWN KRAFT WRAPPING PAPER, SANDWICH 

BAGS
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22

Vinyl gloves, dietary use, powder free, 100/box, 10 boxes/cs, Memphis 

Glove #5000 or approved equal 75.00$                      21.24$                     30.70$                          

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

GROUP 3 TOTAL 222.90$                    313.94$                   30.70$                          

23

Dispenser Napkins, Cafeteria,  7 1/4” x 13 1/2”, 10,1000/cs, Hy-Nap; Tri-

fold 33.50$                      383.50$                   NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

24

Dinner Napkins, 1/8 fold; single ply, 17” x 17”, 5000/cs, Network #510, 

Scott #981800, Texnap #320 or approved equal 32.00$                      178.30$                   NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

25

Dispenser Napkins, 13” x 17”, 6000/cs, Scott #98730, Jas River #250, Ft. 

Howard Mornap #374, Crown #483, Erving #7138 or approved equal 44.00$                      90.16$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

26

Straws, wrapped, 7 3/4”, 24/500’s/cs, Cardinal #11684 or approved 

equal 44.00$                      3.72$                       NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

27

Food handler gloves, polyethylene, disposable, 100/pkg, Memphis Glove 

#5040 or approved equal 3.00$                        NO BID 35.60$                          

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

28

Latex gloves, cleaning, size 10, Impact Pro. #8217, Memphis Glove #5299 

or approved equal 20.00$                      13.32$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

29

Water cup, flat bottom, 4.5 oz., 5000/cs, Lilly #450, Gen Pak #450-F or 

approved equal 46.00$                      176.65$                   NO BID

Packages Per Case 

Manufacturer/Item# 

100/bx - 10 boxes/case 1000

20x500 500/pk-10000/CT

Cascade NO71/ Central 4730280 CSDN071

GROUP 4:  MISCELLANEOUS

IPGVGL-LG / Central 672901 PDF8600M

Strong/SMP 7301x(S/M/L/XL = 

73012/3/4/5

24x250 250/pack-24 pack/carton

Morcon D1217 / Central 332110 KCC98730

20x150 250/pack - 12 pack/carton

Morcon3466 / Central 332115 KCC98200

500/carton 500/bx, 20 per case

Tradex PLG500 / Central 462303

Strong/SMP-7401x (S/M/L/XL= 

74012/3/4/5

24x50 400/pack

Np&P00934 / Central 569934 BWKJSTW77 5S24PK

2500 50/bag-20 bags/carton

GenPakW450F / Central 2660474 DCC4J4

12/pkg 12 pairs

Impact8448 / Central 683170 BWK242L

100/bx, 10 bx/cs
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30

Stir Stick, wooden, wrapped, 10/500’s/cs, Forrester #318 or approved 

equal 76.50$                      30.18$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 10x500

Manufacturer/Item# RoyalR825W / Central 464240

31

Aprons, polyethylene, embossed, white, heavy weight, 28” x 46”, 100/bx, 

Ling #419 or approved equal 24.75$                      141.08$                   NO BID

Packages Per Case 100

Manufacturer/Item# IIDJ10419 / Central 485003

32

Paper towels, natural (brown), single fold, 10” x 10”, James River #812, 

Tagson   #5090, Bay West #470 , * 15.35$                      24.13$                     NO BID

Packages Per Case 16x250

Manufacturer/Item# Essity SK1850A / Central 3355100

GROUP 4 TOTAL 339.10$                    1,041.04$                35.60$                          

GRAND TOTAL GROUPS 1-4 952.70$                    2,234.63$                66.30$                          

500/bx-10 bx/carton

100/carton

KCC44481

250/pack

PNL8210
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MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENT

DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN

ALL OR NONE OFFER

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE BY 

PACA MEMBERS DELIVERY EXCEPTIONS

1.  Central Paper Co, Inc / 140 West Oxmoor Road; Homewood, AL 35209 / Erick Petterson - 205-942-6333

2.  Always Available Wholesale & Supply Corp. / 464 Bass Cr Nw, Huntsville, Alabama 35801 / Deborah Holt - 256-270-8278

3. Strong Medical Partners LLC / 11519 Nations Ford Rd., Suite 200, Pineville, NC 28134 / Charles Fatora - 803-448-5269

No

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

PACA DOCUMENTS YesYes

REQUIRED FORMS
CENTRAL PAPER ALWAYS AVAILABLE 

WHOLESALES & SUPPLY CORP.

1 2

EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY CERTIFICATION FORM

DEBARMENT STATEMENT

SIGNATURE PAGE

BID FORM

EXPERIENCE STATEMENT

NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO RESPOND

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

AFFIDAVIT OF CONTRACTOR

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

$250.00

7 Days 7-10 Days

NO NO

Bidder or Commercial Truck Commerical Truck

Orders < $250 are accepted with a $15 Commerical Truck

5-7 Days

NO

Commerical Truck

Commerical Truck

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

1

STRONG MEDICAL PARTNERS 

LLC

Yes

Yes

Yes


